
\.
Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution Co. Ltd.

Maharashtra State Electricity Distribution Co. Ltd.
Prakashgad, Plot No.G-9, Bandra (East), Mumbai - 400 051

• (P) 26474753, (0) 26474211 126472131, Fax- 26472366, Website www mahaoiscorn in

No. P-com /Theft / ti 1 9 1 4 0 Date: 0 8 JUL 2013
COMMERCIAL CIRCULAR NO. 2 c:J 2-

Sub: Revision of Compounding Charges.

Ref: 1. Commercial Circular No. 133 dated 15.02.2011.
2. Government Notification dated 14 May 2013.

With reference to above subject, all field officers are informed that Government of Maharashtra
has issued Gazette Notification dated 14.05.2013 regarding revision of compounding charges.

The theft cases detected under Section 135 are compoundable as per Section 152 of the
Electricity Act 2003. The offence under Section 135 is compoundable only once. Compounding of the
offence is done if the accused show willingness to pay the civil liabilities and compounding charges.

The revised compounding charges as per Section 152 are as given below:

Rate at which the sum of money for compounding to be
Service collected per Kilowatt (kW) / Horse Power (HP) or

Sr. Nature of Service part thereof for Low Tension (LT) supply and per Kilo Volt
No. Ampere (KVA) of Contracted Demand for High Tension

(HT) supply
Previous Rates Revised Rates

1 Industrial Twenty Thousand Rupees Ten Thousand Rupees
2 Commercial Ten Thousand Rupees Five Thousand Rupees
3 Agriculture Two Thousand Rupees One Thousand Rupees
4 Other Four Thousand Rupees Two Thousand Rupees

All are directed to follow the above instructions strictly. The revised compounding charges as per
the above rates shall be recovered from the date of Government Notification i.e. 14.05.2013. The theft
cases registered prior to Government Notification dated 14.05.2013 is to be dealt as per previous rates of
compounding charges. The Other conditions for compounding of theft cases are as under:

a) The consumer or the person (accused) detected indulging in the "Theft of Electricity" can request
for compounding of offences before the criminal complaint is lodged in the appropriate Court or
even thereafter and the Officer of the Board so authorized by the State Government in this regard
may consider the same, provided the consumer / person deposits a sum of money for
compounding of offence at the rate as prescribed above.

b) It shall neither be obligatory nor binding on the Authorized Officer to permit compounding of
offences in every case and such compounding of offense shall be permitted only after the
consumer / person has unconditionally paid the assessed "Civil Liability".

c) Even after the consumer / person has unconditionally paid the assessed "Civil Liability", if the
Authorized Officer has any objection for permitting the compounding of offences, he shall in
writing submit his objections to the higher authority (in case of 0 & M personnel - Officer not
below the rank of Executive Engineer & in case of Flying Squad units - Deputy Director) and shall



obtain orders from such authority as to whether the compounding of offence should be permitted
or the criminal complaint should be further prosecuted.

d) If the consumer shows willingness to compound the offence, notice specifying assessment
amount shall be issued immediately along with copies of Panchanama etc. After the payment of
assessment amount, compounding charges bill has to be issued immediately. If the consumer
pays the amount immediately, F. 1. R. shall not be filed, but F. 1. R. shall not be delayed if the
consumer does not pay the amount of compounding and assessment for theft immediatelv.

e) The Authorized Officer shall maintain a separate register and shall make necessary entries in such
register of all the cases where the consumer / person has requested in writing for compounding
of offences by depositing the sum of money as per prescribed rate.

f) The facility of compounding of offences shall be permitted only once and therefore in all such
cases, where the consumer has been permitted compounding of offences, necessary entry shall
be taken on the "Consumer Personal Ledger" of such consumer so as to avoid such permission
being given to a consumer on more than one occasion.

g) In respect of persons other than the consumers of the MSEDCL, a separate register for
compounding of offences shall be maintained, so that the said register can be verified to ascertain
whether such person has previously been permitted the facility of compounding of offences.

All field officers are requested to take due note of revised Compounding Charges and take
necessary action accordingly.

End: Govt. Notification

Chief Engineer (Commercial)
Copy: As per mailing List.

C:\RBB\COS\Compounding amount.doe



RNI No. MAHBIL 12009/31733

Reg. No. MHlMRfSouth·322/2013-15

~~~~

~~~I:tH

'h\lW~ ~"fH IP! ~ 3Tfuf.:ltlQ i;:q~ ({<ffi" ~

(\WT ~, ~-3T anftrT~-(WI' ~ ~ ~ ~ q mW tlioqfd~<ti1) ~ q mW.

~, ~ q CfllqalH fcNTaT
~ CfiTl1Tm,~ ~., ~, ~ )(00 o~~, ~ ~)( ~ ~o~~

3ifil~i4"11

~ 3'Ifuf~tlQ, ~oo~.

~ ~ ~o~~l~UF. ~~~G/~-~.- cft\1f~, ~oo~ (~00~"ifT ~G) ~ ~ ~ Bfll ~, ~

~ ~~~~tITc:-~(~) ~ q{QCflliil{ >IGH~ ~ ~CIllR~, ~-rnR, ~~ 3lftIf·FI4I<=<i1~

~,~cft\1f~~~flOicfqo<lI~lal~~~~~~~,~~~4.~~~-~

(~) ~ C'tC@:lIti11«N (~) ~ fqf.:jRte ~ ~ 1~rh1~4Iul wmurr cnW ~ :-
cft\1f ~, ~oo~ (~oo~ 'm ~G) ~ ~ ~ Bfll ~, ~ ~ ~~~ ~ tITc:-~ (~) ~

~- ,

(~) ~ ~qp:rr~nf$:1TffiR ;fk ~~.-
«N (~) ~ " cfRt ~ m "<n 4"11l{IQq"1l " ~ ~ m "~~ ~ cf;;(°<lIC't<ffi;:f.

(~) qlfUlPotCfl Wn<rrUIT~;fk ~~,-
«N (~) ~ " ~ ~ m"<n 4"11l{IQq;;\1 " "4TTl ~ m"m ~ ~ Cfl{O<lIC't<ffi;:f.

(-ffi;r) 'fft:4fq~<lCfl Wn<rrUIT~;fk ~~,-
«N (~) ~ " ~ ~ m "<n 4"11l{IQCl,,·a " ~ ~ m "tn ~ ~ Cfl{O<llrl <ffi;:f.

('m{) ~ Wn<rrUIT~;fk )( ~,-
«N (~) ~ " ~ ~ m "<n 4"11l<IQq"11 " ~ ~ m "m ~ ~ ~ <ffi;:f.

(~)



INDUSTRIES, ENERGY AND LABOUR DEPARTMENT
Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, Mantralaya,

Mumbai 400032, dated the 14th May 2013

NOTIFICATION

ELECTRICITYACT,2003.
No. Misc.2012/C.R.1256/NRG-5.- In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to sub-

section (1) of section 152 of the Elecricity Act, 2003 (36 of 2003), in its application to the State of
Maharashtra, the Government ofMaharashtra hereby amends the rates specified in column (2) ofthe
TABLE below sub-section (1) of the said section 152, at which the sum of money for compounding of
an offence of theft of electricity punishable under t.he said Act sha 11he collected, a!';follows, namely :-

In section 152 of the Electricity Act, 2003 (36 of 2003), in its application to the State of
Maharashtra, in sub-section (1), in the TABLE,-

(i) In entry 1, relating to Industrial Service, in column (2), for the words "twenty thousand
rupees"the words "ten thousand rupees"shall be substituted;

(ii) In entry 2, relating to Commercial Service, in column (2), for the words "ten thousand
rupees" the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(iii) In entry 3, relating to Agricultural Service, in column (2), for the words "two thousand
rupees" the words "one thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(iv) In entry 4, relating to Other Services, in column (2), for the words "four thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

AVINASH SUBHEDAR,

Deputy Secretary to Government.

{VI D 3
E'v'I {I ,--...

ON BEHALF OF GOVERN~NT PRINTING, STATIONERY .''-''ID PUBLICATION, PRINTED A."ID PUBLISHED BY SHRl PA.~HURA_'I1 JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT
GO\O~R~.•'"UmNT CEi'ITr.A.L PRESS. 21-A, ~'1'1ITA..,'1SUDIIASII nOAD, CIlARNI ROAD, ~fUM.BAl 4CC 0041..l"ID PLTB,LISHED AT DIREv'"'TOP •.•"..TE OF COVERN1',ffiNT PE!1'ITING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21·A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAl400 004. EDITOR: SHRI PARSHlJRAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.


